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Why a always man is known by the company he keeps?
The old adage “a man is known by the company he keeps” suggests that the people we
associate with have a significant impact on our own reputations and character. This saying
has been around for centuries and remains just as relevant today as it was when it was first
coined.

The company we keep can say a lot about us. For example, if we are seen hanging out with a
group of dishonest individuals, people may assume that we are untrustworthy as well. On the
other hand, if we are known to associate with kind and upstanding individuals, people may
perceive us as being good and trustworthy.

In many ways, the people we choose to surround ourselves with can influence our behavior. If
we are constantly surrounded by negative individuals, it can be easy to adopt a negative
outlook on life. Similarly, if we surround ourselves with positive and motivated people, it can
be easier for us to stay motivated and focused on our goals.

Additionally, the company we keep can also affect our opportunities in life. If we associate
with people who have a good reputation, it can open doors for us and provide us with valuable
connections. On the other hand, if we are known to associate with individuals who have a poor
reputation, it can limit our opportunities and make it more difficult for us to succeed.
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Ultimately, the company we keep can have a major impact on our lives and it is important to
choose our friends and associates wisely. This does not mean that we should be selective and
only surround ourselves with people who are exactly like us, but rather that we should be
mindful of the company we keep and make sure that the individuals we associate with are
good, positive influences.

It is also worth noting that the company we keep can change over time. As we grow and
evolve, our interests and values may change, leading us to form new friendships and
associations. It is important to be open to these changes and to continue to choose our
company wisely.

In today’s society, where image and reputation are often highly valued, it is more important
than ever to be mindful of the company we keep. In the age of social media, our associations
and relationships can be easily broadcasted to a wide audience, making it easy for others to
form opinions about us based on the people we associate with.

Furthermore, the company we keep can also have legal implications. For example, if we are
seen hanging out with individuals who engage in criminal activity, we may be implicated in
their actions, even if we are not directly involved. This is why it is important to choose our
friends and associates carefully and to avoid getting involved with individuals who engage in
illegal or unethical behavior.

Additionally, the company we keep can affect our mental and emotional well-being. If we
surround ourselves with individuals who are toxic or negative, it can take a toll on our mental
health and lead to feelings of depression and anxiety. On the other hand, if we surround
ourselves with supportive and positive people, it can have a positive impact on our mental and
emotional well-being.

It is also important to remember that we are known by the company we keep not only in our
personal lives, but also in our professional lives. In the workplace, our colleagues and
associates can have a major impact on our careers and opportunities for advancement. If we
are known to associate with individuals who are hardworking and dedicated, it can reflect
positively on us and open up opportunities for us to succeed. On the other hand, if we are
known to associate with individuals who are unreliable or unprofessional, it can have a
negative impact on our careers and opportunities.

So, the company we keep is an important factor in our lives and can have a major impact on
our reputations, behavior, opportunities, and well-being. Therefore, it is important to be
mindful of the individuals we choose to associate with and to make sure that they are positive
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and supportive influences in our lives. By being selective and choosing our company wisely,
we can improve our own lives and enhance our reputations.

In conclusion, the old adage “a man is known by the company he keeps” holds true. The
people we associate with have a significant impact on our own reputations and character and
can influence our behaviour, opportunities, and overall well-being. Therefore, it is important
to choose our friends and associates wisely and to be mindful of the company we keep.
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